
Hui Guo
Of Counsel
China Practice

Email: guohui@yuanhepartners.com

Mr. Guo specializes in civil and commercial dispute resolution, criminal 
defense, litigation representation and corporate compliance. Mr. Guo  
has represented clients in many civil and commercial litigation and 
arbitration cases at different levels of courts and arbitration institutions 
in the areas of loans, real estate transactions, leasing, trademarks, 
copyright, unfair competition, and labor disputes. In the area of 
matrimonial and family law, the cases Mr. Guo has handled involve divorce, 
allocation of real estate and stock equity, child custody, inheritance, 
separation agreements, and distribution of co-owned properties and 
associated legal issues. Mr. Guo also assists clients in drafting prenuptial 
agreements, handling estate planning and notarization, and managing 
cases related to international divorce and inheritance matters.

Mr. Guo also has extensive experience in criminal defense and litigation 
representation. The cases he has represented have been featured in 
special reports by CCTV-13 News Channel’s “Legal Online” program.  
He has provided legal services to protect the legitimate rights and 
interests of victims in cases involving defamation of well-known public 
figures, contract fraud against investors, and damage to corporate 
computer information systems, achieving good social effects.

Mr. Guo has long been a legal consultant for Internet start-ups and 
cultural media enterprises and has extensive experience in corporate 
internal compliance and legal risk management and prevention. 

Mr. Guo is a partner of Yuanhe & Twelve Table and an of counsel  
of Jun Wang & Associates. He has a licensed PRC sports agent.


